MINOR REHAB REPAIR PROGRAM - RFP PROPOSAL OPENING DATE: August 2, 2024 at 9:00am

This list is only one component for consideration of final award.

Proposals are tabulated to identify the ALB (apparent low bidder qualified), however,

the Homeowner must formally make the final Contractor award selection.

Allow ten (10) business days for final, formal confirmation of award.
Contact 318-449-5074 with questions. City of Alexandria Community Development.

gl s

Program Manager Attest

Administrator Attest

Bid’s
Submitted 1003 608 Avoyelles | 611 Avoyelles | 57,8 mill st. 1608 3216 Redwood | 5 10c \wisest. | 36166™st. | 250813%st. | 3835Elderst. | o0 '°nn
Recording Applewhite St. Dr. Dr. Plantation Dr. Dr. Thomas St.
Sheet
B&P
Enterprises $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $9,960.00 $7,780.00 $9,911.00

NO BID

NO BID

$103,053 total this bid tab award for all $63,423 total this page

J: Drive / 03-REHAB / Standard Forms / Rehab Bid Tab FINAL.doc



REHAB REPAIR PROGRAM SERVICE PROPOSAL OPENING DATE: August 2, 2024 at 9:00am

This list is only one component for consideration of final award.
Proposals are tabulated to identify the ALB (apparent low bidder qualified), however, - \
the Homeowner must formally make the final Contractor award selection. /(// K \ Gh/\
Allow five (5) working days for final, formal confirmation of award. / DWMA MMW
Contact 318-449-5074 with questions. City of Alexandria Community Development. Program’ Manager Attest Administrator Attest
Bid’s Submitted
Recording 4913 W. Sandy Bayou Dr. 2704 Willow Glen River Rd. 2322 Wise St. 2732 Mill St. 3651 Orangefield Dr.
Sheet

B&P Enterprises $9,690.00 $9,990.00 $9,995.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

NO BID

NO BID

J: Drive / 03-REHAB / Standard Forms / Rehab Bid Tab FINAL.doc .
$39,630 total this page


Shirley Branham
Text Box
August 2, 2024 at 9:00am




