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          MINOR REHAB REPAIR PROGRAM - RFP PROPOSAL OPENING DATE:  December 06, 2024 at 9:00am 
 This list is only one component for consideration of final award.   

Proposals are tabulated to identify the ALB (apparent low bidder qualified), however,  
the Homeowner must formally make the final Contractor award selection. 
Allow ten (10) business days for final, formal confirmation of award.      ________________________________  ____________________________ 
Contact 318-449-5074 with questions. City of Alexandria Community Development.    Program Manager Attest   Administrator Attest 
 
 

Bid’s 
Submitted 
Recording 

Sheet 

BUNDLE #1 
8 Ball Powell  

St. 
3952 Carlton 

St. 
3623 

Evergreen Dr. 
4107 Jill St. 809 Lafitte St. BUNDLE #2 1746 Levin St. 2128 Levin St. 

3155 Martin 
St. 

1834 Marye 
St. 

1912 Monroe 
St. 

B&P 
Enterprises 

$70,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $10,000.00 $75,000.00 $15,000.00 
 

$15,000.00
 

 
$15,000.00 

 
$15,000.00 

 
$15,000.00 

Affordable 
Residential 

Modifications 
$55,500.00 $12,500.00 $11,500.00 $10,500.00 $8,000.00 $13,000.00 $55,500.00 $10,500.00 $9,500.00

 
 

 
$9,500.00

 $11,500.00
 

 
 

$14,500.00
 

Inline 
Roofing 

$36,200.00 $8,800.00 $8,400.00 $12,000.00 $7,000.00 $13,600.00 $56,200.00 $12,600.00 
 

$11,000.00  
 

$7,200.00
 

 
$12,500.00 

 
$12,900.00 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Note: 809 Lafitte St. will be awarded to B&P Enterprises, as the property is in the floodplain
and the budget limit is $10,000. The remainder of the properties in Bundle #1 will be
awarded to Inline Roofing.
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REHAB REPAIR PROGRAM SERVICE PROPOSAL OPENING DATE:  December 06, 2024 
 This list is only one component for consideration of final award.   

Proposals are tabulated to identify the ALB (apparent low bidder qualified), however,  
the Homeowner must formally make the final Contractor award selection. 
Allow five (5) working days for final, formal confirmation of award.      ________________________________  ____________________________ 
Contact 318-449-5074 with questions. City of Alexandria Community Development.    Program Manager Attest   Administrator Attest 
 
 

Bid’s 
Submitted 
Recording 

Sheet 

BUNDLE #3 2128 Olive St. 
2157 Overton 

St. 
1126 Park Av. 

5707 Richard 
St. 

212 Wheelock 
St. 

BUNDLE #4 1803 Day St. 
6008 

Deerfield Dr. 
3128 Herbert 

St. 
3956 

Jefferson St. 
1811 Polk St. 

B&P 
Enterprises 

$75,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 

 
$25,000.00 

 
$5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 

Affordable 
Residential 

Modifications 
$54,500.00 $9,500.00 $8,500.00 $9,500.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 

 
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Inline 
Roofing 

$53,200.00 $10,200.00 $8,400.00 $9,200.00 $10,400.00 $15,000.00 
 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 

at 9:00am


